
PRESS RELEASE 

CARADO MODEL YEAR 2026  
THREE NEW FLOOR PLANS AND CLEVER DESIGNS 

July 9, 2024 – Leutkirch im Allgäu 

On the road with the Carado V347. © Carado | Additional images available 

Carado is launching the 2026 model year with intelligent innovations. In both the 
campervan and motorhome segments, the brand is presenting new floor plans and 
equipment options that make every day mobile living even more versatile and comfortable. 
Whether a compact all-rounder or a family-friendly space miracle: the new portfolio offers 
even more options for different travel needs. 

The highlight in the campervan segment is the new CV541 pro floor plan. While sharing the 
same dimensions as the CV540, the interior concept has been completely redesigned. 
Inspired by the principle of self-conversion, the CV541 pro combines high functionality with 
a modern, clearly structured design. The driving and living areas are separated. A bench 
toilet with a folding sink makes efficient use of the available space. A permanently installed 

https://www.dropbox.com/scl/fo/9uecuhnrc0mmifk4ajw8r/AMRk62gRiXZx6HGAwMrROts?rlkey=4xvfo4zdqrualtibzm0j10nlb&st=6gcsgein&dl=0


 

staircase with integrated storage compartments leads to the sleeping area in the pop-top 
roof. The concept is complemented by a spacious seating area on a platform in the rear 
with storage space underneath, as well as a tall, space-saving wardrobe with a slim design. 
Also new to the campervan segment is the optionally available solar panel module (TBCF 
100WS), which supports self-sufficient travel – except for models with a pop-top roof. 
 

 

 
Carado is also expanding its range of motorhomes. The focus is on the further developed 
T135 floor plan and the new T328 and V347 models – the latter featuring a market-first 
interior.

With the V347, Carado introduces a particularly versatile floor plan: The side-mounted 
Clever-Lift bed sets new standards in the compact motorhome segment and offers 
particularly space-saving sleeping solutions. When folded, it sits discreetly against the wall; 
if necessary, it can be folded down and hovered above the seating area – without 
obstructing the vehicle's entry area. Another advantage: when folded, the standing height 
in the front of the vehicle is maintained, which is particularly beneficial for taller people and 
creates a pleasant feeling of space. An additional advantage for those traveling with several 
people is that the seating area can optionally be converted into an additional sleeping area. 
With this optional extra, the sleeping capacity can be expanded to four. 

With the T328, Carado is expanding its portfolio with a new floor plan based on the proven 
T338 – but with targeted optimisations in detail. The compact, integrated, narrower 
refrigerator offers a generous volume of 137 Liters despite its space-saving design, allowing 
for convenient storage. The adapted interior layout allows for the optional integration of a 
fifth seat – without changing the vehicle length or restricting the bed length. Like all 
Carado semi-integrated models, the T328 is also available with a fold-down bed as an 
option

 
The popular floor plan with a French bed has been enhanced with a functional upgrade: For 
the first time, the model is available with an optional fold-down bed. This means the T135 
now offers comfortable accommodation for up to four people. A real added value for 
anyone looking to combine compact exterior dimensions with additional interior versatility. 

 

With the 2026 model year, Carado offers a well-thought-out further development of its 
portfolio. New floor plans, clever use of space, and updated classic models offer more 
options for different travel styles. The expanded floor plan portfolio is now complemented 
by enhanced connectivity: An optional mobile internet module for the vehicles provides a 
stable connection on the go, whether for navigation, streaming, or remote work. 



 

 

Carado GmbH is a company of the Erwin Hymer Group. Carado offers durable and well-designed camper vans and 

motorhomes with the best value for money in the entry-level segment. These convince with practical and solid 

functionality, high quality "made in Germany" and modern design with intelligent details. They are also characterised by 

maximum reliability and safety as well as comfort and by versatility. Carado is the brand for families, singles, couples 

and for all people who are looking for a home for time on the road, a place where they feel good, with which they can 

visit their favourite places and in whose life the journey plays a very special role.  

For more information see www.carado.com/de 

 

Carado GmbH takes the protection of your personal data very seriously. Information on data protection can be  

found here. 
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The Erwin Hymer Group is a wholly-owned subsidiary of THOR Industries, one of the world's leading 

manufacturers of recreational vehicles with over 32,000 employees. The Erwin Hymer Group brings together 

motorhome and caravan manufacturers, accessories specialists and rental and financing services under one 

roof. The Erwin Hymer Group includes the motorhome and caravan brands Buccaneer, Bürstner, Carado, 

Crosscamp, Compass, Dethleffs, Elddis, Eriba, Etrusco, Hymer, Laika, LMC, Niesmann+Bischoff, Sunlight and 

Xplore, the rental companies Crossrent, McRent and rent easy, the suspension specialist Goldschmitt, the 

Chassis expert Movera and the travel portal freeontour. For more information, visit 

https://www.erwinhymergroup.com/de. 
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